The City of

OKLAHOMA CITY

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

APPROVED

9-27-2022

August 2, 2022

BY THE CITY COUNCIL

Baysingers Uniforms and Equipment
430 E Central Ave

Wichita, KS 67202
Dear Vendor:

The Contracting Entity and the contracting vendor have the option of renewing Contract/Pricing
Agreement No. R22-C217057 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment
and Supplies for the term 10/24/2022 through 10/23/2023 under the same terms,
conditions and provisions as originally awarded, including price(s).

Please indicate your concurrence or non-concurrence by completing the below listed information,
including signature. and return to me by August 24, 2022. If the individual signing below is not
the owner or an officer of the business or corporation, a letter of authorization should also be
attached. Corporate Seal will be accepted in lieu of an authorization letter if affixed to this
document.

YOUR CONCURRENCE DOES NOT GUARANTEE RENEWAL. Should the Contracting
Entity decide not to renew the above contract, you will be notified in writing or
electronically. This form may be mailed, faxed, emailed, scanned, or otherwise
electronically submitted for contract/pricing agreement renewal.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (405) 297-3172, Fax (405) 297-2142 or

(g7 g CITY CLERK

Email: jennifer.swann@okc.gov.

C ey

7 e
Jennifer Swann MPA, CPO
Senior Buyer

Yes, I would like to renew
per the above mentioned.

No, I do not wish to renew.

[INTERNAL USE ONLY]

The Contracting Entity
chooses not to renew the
above contract/pricing
agreement.

D, il

PRINTED NAME

ﬂes- y.q. 7[

AYFPHORIZED SIGNATURE
Sopsnger Plie Spely M

COMPANY NAME

930 & Gt/ Aoe
STREET ADDRESS
Lfehiby .3 §F202

CITY, STATE AND ZIP CODE
e 2L2-Sb3
BUSINESS TELEPHONE
bria~@ baysmiers . cem
CONTACT E-MAIL/

Procurement Services 100 North Walker e Oklahoma City, OK 73102 ¢ 405-297-2741




***The discount range below allows us to negotiate
special pricing on a case by case basis with our
manufaturers. Anytime we can negotiate special pricing
we pass on the savings

Commercial Name Website URLs Products Discount Range

511 hitps://www.511tactical com/ Gear, Tactical, Footwear, Uniforms, etc 15-28%
Ameriglo https://ameriglo.com/ Gun Sites 15-23%
FORENSICS SOURCE https://forensicssource com/ Forensics 5.00%
ASSEMBLED PRODUCTS CORP https://www.assembledproducts.com/ Batons, Handuffs, Flashlights 5.00%
Avon Protection Systems Inc. https://www.avon-protection.com/ Gas Maks, SCBA's, Papr's Riot & CBRN Filters 10-22%
BATES https://www batesfootwear.com/US/en/home Footwear 20-30%

BAYLY HATS https://baylyhats com/ Dress Caps 5-10%
BEAR-AIDE INC http://bear-aide.com/ Traffic Aide 5.00%
BENCHMADE KNIFE COMPANY https://www.benchmade.com/ Knives 12-25%
BIANCHI INTERNATIONAL https://safariland.com/pages/bianchi Duty Gear 15-25%
BLACKHAWK https://blackhawk.com/ Tactical and Duty Gear 12-20%
BLACKINTON https://www blackinton.com/ Badges, Insignia, etc, 10-20%

BLACK FIRE FORGE hitt fireforgeusa.com/ Rifles 4-6%
BLAUER MFG COMPANY, INC. https://www.blaver.com/ Uniforms 6-35%
BOSTON LEATHER https://www.bostonleather.com/ Leather Duty Gear Products 5.00%
BRODER BROTHERS https://www.alphabroder.com/ Assorted Apparrel 15-25%
Bulldog Cases & Vaults https://www.bulldogcases.com/ Cases and Vaults 10-30%
BUSHNELL https://www.hushnell com/ Binoculars 5.00%

CALIBRE PRESS INC https://www.calibrepress.com/ Books 5.00%

Code Red Headsets https://www.coderedheadsets. com/ Patrol Headsets & Comms 3-5%
COMPETITION CHEMICALS http://www.competitionchemicals.com/ Metal Polish 5.00%
CONCEPT SEATING https://www.conceptscating. com/ Vehicle Equipment 5.00%
CONDOR TACTICAL https://condoroutdoor.com/ Tactical Apparel and Gear 10-35%
DANNER, INC https://www.danner.com/ Footwear 5-20%
DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY https://www.defense-technology.com/ Less Lethal Products 2.00%
DICKIES INDUSTRIAL WEAR https://www.dickies.com/mens-clothing/ Industrial Uniforms 5-10%
DMA INC. https://dma-inc net/ Stunguns & Personal Protection 10-15%
DON HUME LEATHERGOODS https://www.donhume com/ Leather Duty Gear Products 15-25%
DUNBROOKE https://www.dunbrocke.com/ Assorted Apparrel 5-10%
DUTYMAN POLICE EQUIPMENT http://dutymanstore.com/ Duty Gear 5.00%
EDGE TACTICAL EYEWEAR https://tactical edgeeyewear.com/ Eyewear 15-18%
EDWARDS GARMENT COMPANY https://www.edwardsgarment.com/ Uniforms 15-25%
EES-COPLITE NA Vehicle Equipment 5.00%

ELBECO https://www.elbeco.com/ Uniforms 20-25%

Elite First Aid Inc https://elitefirstaidinc.com/ First Aid items and kits 5-10%
EOTech https://www.eotechine cam/ Tactical Optics 5-10%
FECHHEIMER http://www.fechheimer.com/ Unifarms 30-40%
FEDERAL SIGNAL CORP https://www.federalsignal com/ Vehicle Equipment 5-20%
FOBUS USA https://fobusholster.com/ Duty Gear 5.00%

https://www.gamesportswear.com/CGl-

SAMESFORISWEAR BIN/LANSAWEE?PROCFUN+WEBC+WEBCLG2+A01+ENG Assprad Appareel 10.00%
GA-REL MANUFACTURING CO http://www.garel.com/ Unifarm Accessories 5.00%
GARRETT METAL DETECTORS https://garrett. com/welcome Metal Detectors 18-22%

GIBSON & BARNES http://www.gibson-barnes.com/ Flight Suits 5.00%

Glendale Parade Store https://glendale.com/ Military Style Dress Uniform Items 5.00%
Glock www glock com Handguns Blue Label

GOULD & GOODRICH https://gouldusa.cam/ Duty Gear 10-18%

HATCH GLOVES https://safariland.com/collections/hatch Gloves, Riot Gear, Assorted Gear 25-30%

HATTRAP INC http://www hattrap.com/ Dress Cap Holders 5.00%

Haix https://www.haixusa.com/ Footwear 8-18%

HERO'S PRIDE http://www.herospride.com/ Patches, Collar Brass, Insignia 10-50%

High Speed Gear https://www.highspeedgear.com/ Pouches, Gear Holders, Holsters, Vests 10-17%

Holosun Technologies Inc. https://holosun.com/ Firearm Sites 15-25%

HORACE SMALL https://www.horacesmall.com/ Uniforms 5.00%

HUMANE RESTRAINT https://www.humanerestraint com/ Restraints 5.00%

INTERSTATE BATTERY https://www.interstatebatteries.com/ Batteries 5.00%

| SPIEWAK & SONS, INC, https://www.spiewak.com/ Uniforms & Outerwear 30-50%

JEFFERIES htips://www jefferiessocks.com/ Socks 5.00%

KEYSTONE UNIFORM CAPS https://www keystoneuniformcap com/ Dress Caps 8-16%

Kingform Cap Company Inc https://www.kingformeap.com/ Dress Caps 5.00%

KLENCH NA Uniform Insignia & Decorations 5.00%

Kroll International, LLC https://www krollcorp.com/ Assorted Public Safety Apparel and Gear 5.00%




L3 https://www.13harris. com/ Night Vision Devices 3-5%

L3 https://www.|3harris.com/ Laser Aiming Devices 3-5%

L3 https://www.[3harris.com/ Thermal Devices 3-5%
LANDAU UNIFORMS INC https://www.landau.com/ Scrubs, Labcoats, and other Unifarms 10-20%
LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY http://www.porta-clip com/ Law Enforcement Gear 5.00%
Lee Reed https://leereedinc espwebsite.com/ Custom Engraved Items 5.00%

LIBERTY UNIFORM MFG CO https://www.libertyuniform. com/ Uniforms 5.00%
LION APPAREL https://www. lionprotects.com/ Uniforms 5.00%
Mantis https://mantisx.com/ Firearms Training Systems 10-35%

MARK PRO GEAR htips://www.markprogear.com/products Force on Force Gear 6.00%
Marlow White https://www.marlowwhite.cam/ Dress Uniforms 5.00%
MJ SOFFE https://www.soffe com/ Assorted Apparrel 15.00%

MOCEAN http//www.moceanla.com/ Uniforms 5.00%

MONADNOCK https://safariland.com/ Batons, Handuffs, and other Less Lethal Items 3-7%

NEESE INDUSTRIES, INC https://neeseind.com/ Outerwear and Apparel 5.00%
NIK PUBLIC SAFETY https://forensicssource.com/ Testing and Evidence Collection 5.00%
North American Rescue https://www.narescue.com/ First Aid items and kits 5-20%
OAKLEY https://www.oakley com/en-us Glasses, Bags, Apparel, and more 15-25%
OTTO CAP https://ottocap.com/ Hats & Caps 22-26%
PALILSON MANUFACTURING CORP https://www paulsonmfg.com/ Riot Shields, Face Shields, Goggles, and more 5-10%
PEERLESS HANDCUFF COMPANY https://www.peerless.net/ Handeuffs & Restraints 20-30%
Penn Emblem Company http://pennemblem com/ Emblems 5.00%
Perfect Fit https://www perfectfitusa.com/ Duty Gear, Wallets, Badge Holders 5.00%
PERSONAL SAFETY OUTLET NA Personal Safety 5.00%
POLYCONCEPT NORTH AMERICA https://www.pcna.com/en-us Imprintable Gear & Apparel 10-20%
Porta Clip https://www.porta-clip.com/ Radio Clips 5.00%

PREMIER CROWN CORP NA Helmets and Riot Gear 5.00%
PREMIER EMBLEM hitp://www.premier-emblem.com/ Emblems, Insignia, & More 20-25%
PRO-GARD INDUSTRIES htips://www.pro-gard.com/ Vehicle Equipment 5.00%
PROLOCK https://www.pro-lok.com/ Lock Pics, Pic Sets, and mare 5.00%
PROPPER INTERNATL SALES https://www.propper.com/ Uniforms 10-28%
QUIQLITE https://www.quiglite.com/ Lighting Equipment 10.00%

Redback Boots USA https://www.redbackboots.com/ Boots 5-12%
REDKAP https://www.sanmar.cam/ Industrial Uniforms 5-12%
REFLECTIVE APPAREL https://www.reflectiveapparel com/ Reflective Uniforms & Quterwear 8-10%
RICHARDSON https://richardsonsports.com/ Hats & Caps 10-20%
Rocky Brands Wholesale, LLC https://www.rockybrands.com/ Footwear 8-15%
ROLATAPE CORP http://wiww.rolatape.com/us/en/home/measuring- Measuring Wheels and more 5.00%
wheels. html
ROTHCO https://www.rothco.com/ Assorted Apparrel 10-15%
RSR Group https://www.rsrgroup.com/ Firearms, Accessories, etc. 5.00%
RUSSELL BRANDS, LLC http://www.russell-brands.com/pages/contactUs html Assorted Apparrel 12-20%
SAFARILAND/PROTECH ARMOR hitps://safariland.com/pages/protech-armor-systems Body Armor 28-42%
SAFARILAND Duty Gear https://safariland.com/pages/safariland-duty-gear Duty Gear 18-26%
Salamaon https://www.saloman.cam/ Footwear 15-20%
SAMUEL BROOME UNIFORM ACC http://www.broomeaccessories.com/ Ties, Dress Uniform Items, and more 5.00%
SANMAR https://www.sanmar.com/ Assorted Apparrel & Gear 8-25%
SAUNDERS MANUFACTURING https://saunders-usa.com/ Clipboards, Holders, etc. 5.00%
SECURITY EQUIPMENT CORP https://www.sabrered.com/ Personal Safety 5.00%
SETINA MFG, CO INC https://setina.com/ Vehicle Equipment 5.00%
SIGNAL VEHICLE PRODUCTS https://www.vehiclesafetysupply.com/signal-vehicle- Vehicle Equipment 5.00%
products-c-1_14.html

SMITH & WARREN https://www.smithwarren com/home Badges, Awards, Insignia, etc. 17-23%
Sound Off Signal https://soundoffsignal.com/ Vehicle Equipment 5.00%
S&S Activewear https://www.ssactivewear.com/ Assorted Apparrel 10-25%
STALLION LEATHER https://www.stallionleather.com/ Duty Gear 5.00%
STRATTON HATS, INC https://strattonhats.com/ Duty Hats & Caps 5.00%
STREAMLIGHT, INC https://www.streamlight.com/ Flashlights, Accessories, Batteries, etc. 28-40%
STRONG GROUP INC https://www.strong-group.com/ Wallets and Duty Gear 10.00%
SUREFIRE https://www.surefire.com/ Flashlights, Accessories, Batteries, etc. 3-20%
TACTICAL COMMAND INDUSTRIES https://safariland.com/pages/safariland-communications Communication Gear 3-20%
TEX SHOEMAKER & SONS NA Duty Gear 5.00%
THE GUN SHOP https://idahofalls.mtodinge com/ Force on Force Gear & Ammunition 5.00%
THORLO https://thorlo.com/ Sorcks 5.00%
THOROGOOD https://www.thorogoodusa.com/ Footwear 18-25%
TINGLEY https://www tingleyrubber.com/ Uniforms & Outerwear 5-10%

Title Boxing Club https://titleboxingclub.com/ Training Equipment 5-8%
TOPPS https://www.topps.com/ Uniforms 5.00%




Traffic Control Services https://www.tcs-ks.com/ Traffic Control Items 5.00%
TRAFFIC INSTITUTE https://trafficinstitute.com/ Traffic Aide 5.00%
Trijicon, Inc. https://www. trijicon com/ Sites, Red Dots, Scopes, & more 5-20%

TRI-MOUNTAIN https://www . trimountain.com/ Assorted Apparel 12-18%
Truck Vault https://truckvault.com/ Vehicle Equipment 3-6%

UNCLE MIKE'S https://unclemikes.com/ Duty Gear 5.00%

UNDER ARMOUR https://www.underarmour.com/en-us/ Footwear & Apparrel 15-20%

Veridian https://www.veridian.net/ Fire Protective Gear 22-27%

Vertx https://vertx.com/ Tactical Apparel and Gear 22-28%

VIKTOS https://www.viktos.com/ Unifarms & Footwear 5.00%

VISUAL IMAGE SYSTEM https://www.visco graphics/ Decals and more 5.00%

Vortex Optics https://vortexoptics. com/ Sites, Red Dots, Scopes, & more 15-40%

W. ALBOUM HAT CO, INC https://www.walboumhatco.com/ Uniform Hats & Caps 5-10%
Wichita Gun Club Wichita Gun Club Firearms 5.00%

WOLF PEAK INTERNATL INC NA Eyewear 12.00%
WORKRITE UNIFORM COMPANY https://www.bulwark.com/ Uniforms 5.00%
ZAKTOOL https://www.zaktool.com/ Cuff Keys & Restraints 5-10%




The City of
OKLAHOMA CITY

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
PPROVE
August 2, 2022 A 9-27-2022 D
Cops Products BY THE
416 Hudiburg Circle Suite B Qg4 3:%;32’ gl?‘? gt,ECI‘?LK

Oklahoma City, OK 73108
Dear Vendor:

The Contracting Entity and the contracting vendor have the option of renewing Contract/Pricing
Agreement No. R22-C217058 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment and
Supplies for the term 10/24/2022 through 10/23/2023 under the same terms, conditions and
provisions as originally awarded, including price(s).

Please indicate your concurrence or non-concurrence by completing the below listed information,
including signature, and return to me by August 24, 2022. If the individual signing below is not
the owner or an officer of the business or corporation, a letter of authorization should also be
attached. Corporate Seal will be accepted in lieu of an authorization letter if affixed to this
document.

YOUR CONCURRENCE DOES NOT GUARANTEE RENEWAL. Should the Contracting
Entity decide not to renew the above contract, you will be notified in writing or
electronically. This form may be mailed, faxed, emailed, scanned, or otherwise
electronically submitted for contract/pricing agreement renewal.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (405) 297-3172, Fax (405) 297-2142 or
Email: jennifer.swann@okc.gov.

(/Zﬁf*j“ ~ OBU% OOV%V

oty
Jennifer Swann MPA, CPO Q\J\(\ \&\\, 0’\
Senior Buyer & Q
0

| @5 , JWNAT,
é Yes, I would like to renew (\ . TIT \ K\/\—/
per the above mentioned. g\)<\ 7‘;\;

ey | Scho eabserger

PRINTED NAME

No, I do not wish to renew. AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

[INTERNAL USE ONLY] VY5 “Product

STREET ADDRESS P v 1IN
______ The Contracting Entity i, Hudrburg Gr. S B, KL 13108
chooses not to renew the CITY, STATE AND ZIP CODE ’ '
above contract/pricing 4—%@5—* 232 -1300
agreement. BUSINESS TELEPHONE

o Bonsp rOAWAS . o~
CONTACT E-MAIL | U

Procurement Services 100 North Walker « Oklahoma City, OK 73102 ¢ 405-297-2741



City of Oklahoma City and 21710
its Trusts
21710-10-01 BASIC UNIFORM -  Supplier Product First Offer - $128.80 1/each $128.80 Y
FLASHLIGHT: . Code: 75811
FLASHLIGHT -CIS
. Supplier Notes:
- STREANLIGHT STINGER C4 DS
| LED W/ AC CHARGER. C
21710--10-02 BASIC UNIFORM -  Supplier Product First Offer - $146.26 1/each $146.26 Y 2
FLASHLIGHT: Code: 75455
FLASHLIGHT -
POLICE Supplier Notes:
STREAMLIGHT STINGER C4 DS
LED HL FLASHLIGHT W AC
CHARGER.
Lot Total $275.06 O
Item # Line Item Notes Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs
21710-11-01  BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer - $159.00 1/each $159.00 Y i
FOOTWEAR: FOOTWEAR - Code: 834-6211
LEATHER UNIFORM
BOOTS Supplier Notes:
THOROGOOD
WELLINGTON BOOTS.
21710--11-02 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $31.50 1/each $31.50 Y

FOOTWEAR: FOOTWEAR  Code: 5055 / 5085
€ LEATHER UNIFORM

SHOES

Supplier Notes: 5055 -

ROTHCO HI-GLOSS

OXFORD SHOES - $31.50

5085 - ROTHCO POLI

TOE OXFORD SHOES
$38.00

SH

o

\\,
)}L&O\(} - X(\\ \L

f) \\‘

dolkle”

A

/\“@’y

21710-11-03 BASIC UNIFORM -

. Supplier Product

FOOTWEAR: FOOTWEAR  Code: 831-6031
© UNIFORM OPTION 1

9/15/2020

Supplier Notes: !

BidSync

First Offer - $59.90

1/each

$59.90



City of Oklahoma City and 21710
its Trusts
MATCHES RIPP.
« 21710--26-02 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $13.30 1/each $13.30 Y
RESTRAINTS: MAXIMAL Code: HRSB-100
RESTRAINTS -HOBBLE
Supplier Notes:
HUMANE RESTRAINT -
MATCHES RIPP.
Lot Total $26.55 2
Item # Line Item Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs
21710-27-01 BASICUNIFORM-  Supplier Product Code: NO  First Offer- $0.00 1/ each $0.00 Y 1
SHIRT: SHIRT - JERSEY  BID i
SHIRT - OPTIONAL |
supplier Notes: NO BID 7
21710--27-02 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $55.20 1/each $55.20 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - Code: 8670-12-XX
UNIFORM - SUPERSHIRT l’\
OPTIONAL- LONG Supplier Notes: BLAUER /% /\
SLEEVE L/S SUPERSHIRT W/ 2 ':)
PATCHES. ADD 10% FOR
EACH SIZE 2X +. 5
21710-27-03 BASICUNIFORM-  Supplier Product First Offer- $52.91 1/each $52.91 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - . Code: 8675-12-XX 8
UNIFORM - SUPERSHIRT q
OPTIONAL-SHORT = Supplier Notes: BLAUER L& \0
SLEEVE | S/SSUPERSHIRTW/2 6 !
PATCHES. ADD 10% FOR
EACHSIZE 2X+.
21710--27-04 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer - $46.00 1/each $46.00 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - Code: Z3311N
UNIFORM -BUTTON
STYLE, PERM PRESS, Supplier Notes: ELBECO
SHORT SLEEVE GREY S/S SHIRT W/ ZIPPERS,
2 PATCHES, NO OVERSIZE
CHARGES.
21710-27-05 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $52.00 1/each $52.00 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - Code: Z311N

9/15/2020

UNIFORM-BUTTON

Supplier Notes: ELBECO

BidSync



City of Oklahoma City and 21710
its Trusts
21710--34-02 BASIC UNIFORM -BATON: Supplier Product First Offer- $39.22 1/each $39.22 Y
BATON € NIGHT STICK Code: PLP26
Supplier Notes:
MONADNOCK
Lot Total $164.38
Item # Line Item Notes Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs !
21710-35-01 BASIC UNIFORM -BATON  Supplier Product First Offer- $9.21 1/each $9.21 Y
HOLDER: BATON HOLDER - Code: 675
LEATHER -FOR STRAIGHT
STICK Supplier Notes:
SAFARILAND DOUBLE
RING, HI-GLOSS W/
BRASS SNAPS. 7
21710--35-02 BASIC UNIFORM -BATON  Supplier Product First Offer- $22.92 1/each $22.92 Y O
HOLDER: BATON HOLDER - Code: 3‘5;!121—_@_
LEATHER -FOR \6
EXPANDABLE BATON Supplier Notes: R
MONADNOCK STX HI- e
GLOSS OPEN TOP
BATON HOLDER.
Lot Total $32.13
Item # Line Item Notes Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs
21710-36-01 CIVILIAN Supplier Product Code: 6125 First Offer - $167.88 1/each $167.88 Y
UNIFORMS: ’
FOUL WEATHER Supplier Notes: BLAUER W/ 2
JACKET - PST PATCHES & EMBROIDERED FLAG.
BE ADVISED THAT EMBROIDERING
DIRECT TO JACKET WILL CAUSE
WATER REPELLENT FABRIC TO FAIL
IN THAT SPOT. SEWN ON FLAG
WILL LIMIT IT AND COST WILL GO
DOWN BY $7.00. ADD 10% FOR
EACH SIZE 2X +, THE 6125 ISTHE
6120 WITH PILE COLLAR.
21710--36-02 CIVILIAN Supplier Product Code: 90015-5 First Offer- $5.90 1/each $5.90 Y

UNIFORMS:
NECKTIE - PST

9/15/2020

Supplier Notes: SAMUEL

BidSync

p. 17



City of Oklahoma City and 21710
its Trusts
Supplier Notes:
RICHARDSON W/ REQUESTED
EMBROIDERY.
21710--37-02 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product First Offer- $21.51 1/each $21.51 Y
SHIRT-ACADEMY  Code: SP66MB 2
UNIFORM SHIRT
Supplier Notes: HORACE /
SMALL, NO OVERSIZE H2
CHARGES. ADD $5 FOR qf) ; 1
HEMMING.
21710-37-03 RECRUIT UNIFORIV!?S: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
' SHIRT -T-SHIRT- BID e
ACADEMY f
INSTRUCTOR Supplier Notes: NO BID
21710--37-04 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SHIRT -T-SHIRT- BID
RECRUIT
Supplier Notes: NO BID
21710-37-05 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SHORTS -RECRUIT | BID L
AND INSTRUCTOR | 5
| Supplier Notes: NOBID
21710--37-06 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SWEATPANTS - BID
ACADEMY
INSTRUCTOR Supplier Notes: NO BID
9/15/2020 BidSync

p. 22



City of Oklahoma City and 21710
its Trusts
21710-37-07 RECRUIT UNIFORMSE: Supplier Product Codje: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SWEATPANTS - . BID %
RECRUIT
Supplier Notes: NO BID (
21710--37-08 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SWEATSHIRT - BID
ACADEMY
INSTRUCTOR Supplier Notes: NO BID
21710-37-09 RECRUIT UNEFORM$:  Supplier Product Cocile: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y O
SWEATSHIRT - . 3 5
RECRUIT
Supplier Notes:
NO BID 5
21710--37-10 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product First Offer- $25.96 1/each $25.96 Y
TROUSER - RECRUIT  Code: HS2370 8

9/15/2020

Supplier Notes: HORACE

CHARGES. ADD $5.00 FOR
HEMMING.

SMALL, NO OVERSIZE ?/0\.\%

BidSync

p. 23



City of Oklahoma City and 21710
its Trusts
21710-10-01 BASIC UNIFORM -  Supplier Product First Offer - $128.80 1/each $128.80 Y
FLASHLIGHT: . Code: 75811
FLASHLIGHT -CIS
. Supplier Notes:
- STREANLIGHT STINGER C4 DS
| LED W/ AC CHARGER. C
21710--10-02 BASIC UNIFORM -  Supplier Product First Offer - $146.26 1/each $146.26 Y 2
FLASHLIGHT: Code: 75455
FLASHLIGHT -
POLICE Supplier Notes:
STREAMLIGHT STINGER C4 DS
LED HL FLASHLIGHT W AC
CHARGER.
Lot Total $275.06 O
Item # Line Item Notes Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs
21710-11-01  BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer - $159.00 1/each $159.00 Y i
FOOTWEAR: FOOTWEAR - Code: 834-6211
LEATHER UNIFORM
BOOTS Supplier Notes:
THOROGOOD
WELLINGTON BOOTS.
21710--11-02 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $31.50 1/each $31.50 Y

FOOTWEAR: FOOTWEAR  Code: 5055 / 5085
€ LEATHER UNIFORM

SHOES

Supplier Notes: 5055 -

ROTHCO HI-GLOSS

OXFORD SHOES - $31.50

5085 - ROTHCO POLI

TOE OXFORD SHOES
$38.00

SH

o

\\,
)}L&O\(} - X(\\ \L

f) \\‘

dolkle”

A

/\“@’y

21710-11-03 BASIC UNIFORM -

. Supplier Product

FOOTWEAR: FOOTWEAR  Code: 831-6031
© UNIFORM OPTION 1

9/15/2020

Supplier Notes: !

BidSync

First Offer - $59.90

1/each

$59.90



City of Oklahoma City and 21710
its Trusts
MATCHES RIPP.
« 21710--26-02 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $13.30 1/each $13.30 Y
RESTRAINTS: MAXIMAL Code: HRSB-100
RESTRAINTS -HOBBLE
Supplier Notes:
HUMANE RESTRAINT -
MATCHES RIPP.
Lot Total $26.55 2
Item # Line Item Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs
21710-27-01 BASICUNIFORM-  Supplier Product Code: NO  First Offer- $0.00 1/ each $0.00 Y 1
SHIRT: SHIRT - JERSEY  BID i
SHIRT - OPTIONAL |
supplier Notes: NO BID 7
21710--27-02 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $55.20 1/each $55.20 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - Code: 8670-12-XX
UNIFORM - SUPERSHIRT l’\
OPTIONAL- LONG Supplier Notes: BLAUER /% /\
SLEEVE L/S SUPERSHIRT W/ 2 ':)
PATCHES. ADD 10% FOR
EACH SIZE 2X +. 5
21710-27-03 BASICUNIFORM-  Supplier Product First Offer- $52.91 1/each $52.91 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - . Code: 8675-12-XX 8
UNIFORM - SUPERSHIRT q
OPTIONAL-SHORT = Supplier Notes: BLAUER L& \0
SLEEVE | S/SSUPERSHIRTW/2 6 !
PATCHES. ADD 10% FOR
EACHSIZE 2X+.
21710--27-04 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer - $46.00 1/each $46.00 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - Code: Z3311N
UNIFORM -BUTTON
STYLE, PERM PRESS, Supplier Notes: ELBECO
SHORT SLEEVE GREY S/S SHIRT W/ ZIPPERS,
2 PATCHES, NO OVERSIZE
CHARGES.
21710-27-05 BASIC UNIFORM - Supplier Product First Offer- $52.00 1/each $52.00 Y
SHIRT: SHIRT - Code: Z311N

9/15/2020

UNIFORM-BUTTON

Supplier Notes: ELBECO
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21710--34-02 BASIC UNIFORM -BATON: Supplier Product First Offer- $39.22 1/each $39.22 Y
BATON € NIGHT STICK Code: PLP26
Supplier Notes:
MONADNOCK
Lot Total $164.38
Item # Line Item Notes Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs !
21710-35-01 BASIC UNIFORM -BATON  Supplier Product First Offer- $9.21 1/each $9.21 Y
HOLDER: BATON HOLDER - Code: 675
LEATHER -FOR STRAIGHT
STICK Supplier Notes:
SAFARILAND DOUBLE
RING, HI-GLOSS W/
BRASS SNAPS. 7
21710--35-02 BASIC UNIFORM -BATON  Supplier Product First Offer- $22.92 1/each $22.92 Y O
HOLDER: BATON HOLDER - Code: 3‘5;!121—_@_
LEATHER -FOR \6
EXPANDABLE BATON Supplier Notes: R
MONADNOCK STX HI- e
GLOSS OPEN TOP
BATON HOLDER.
Lot Total $32.13
Item # Line Item Notes Unit Price  Qty/Unit Attch. Docs
21710-36-01 CIVILIAN Supplier Product Code: 6125 First Offer - $167.88 1/each $167.88 Y
UNIFORMS: ’
FOUL WEATHER Supplier Notes: BLAUER W/ 2
JACKET - PST PATCHES & EMBROIDERED FLAG.
BE ADVISED THAT EMBROIDERING
DIRECT TO JACKET WILL CAUSE
WATER REPELLENT FABRIC TO FAIL
IN THAT SPOT. SEWN ON FLAG
WILL LIMIT IT AND COST WILL GO
DOWN BY $7.00. ADD 10% FOR
EACH SIZE 2X +, THE 6125 ISTHE
6120 WITH PILE COLLAR.
21710--36-02 CIVILIAN Supplier Product Code: 90015-5 First Offer- $5.90 1/each $5.90 Y

UNIFORMS:
NECKTIE - PST

9/15/2020

Supplier Notes: SAMUEL

BidSync
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Supplier Notes:
RICHARDSON W/ REQUESTED
EMBROIDERY.
21710--37-02 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product First Offer- $21.51 1/each $21.51 Y
SHIRT-ACADEMY  Code: SP66MB 2
UNIFORM SHIRT
Supplier Notes: HORACE /
SMALL, NO OVERSIZE H2
CHARGES. ADD $5 FOR qf) ; 1
HEMMING.
21710-37-03 RECRUIT UNIFORIV!?S: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
' SHIRT -T-SHIRT- BID e
ACADEMY f
INSTRUCTOR Supplier Notes: NO BID
21710--37-04 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SHIRT -T-SHIRT- BID
RECRUIT
Supplier Notes: NO BID
21710-37-05 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SHORTS -RECRUIT | BID L
AND INSTRUCTOR | 5
| Supplier Notes: NOBID
21710--37-06 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SWEATPANTS - BID
ACADEMY
INSTRUCTOR Supplier Notes: NO BID
9/15/2020 BidSync
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21710-37-07 RECRUIT UNIFORMSE: Supplier Product Codje: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SWEATPANTS - . BID %
RECRUIT
Supplier Notes: NO BID (
21710--37-08 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product Code: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y
SWEATSHIRT - BID
ACADEMY
INSTRUCTOR Supplier Notes: NO BID
21710-37-09 RECRUIT UNEFORM$:  Supplier Product Cocile: NO First Offer- $0.00 1/each $0.00 Y O
SWEATSHIRT - . 3 5
RECRUIT
Supplier Notes:
NO BID 5
21710--37-10 RECRUIT UNIFORMS: Supplier Product First Offer- $25.96 1/each $25.96 Y
TROUSER - RECRUIT  Code: HS2370 8

9/15/2020

Supplier Notes: HORACE

CHARGES. ADD $5.00 FOR
HEMMING.

SMALL, NO OVERSIZE ?/0\.\%

BidSync
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The City of
OKLAHOMA CITY

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

“I’F’R O‘VIEl)

August 2, 2022 9-27-2022

BY THE CITY COUNCIL
Galls LLC (g Sngesrm CITY CLERK
1340 Russell Cave Rd

Lexington, KY 40505
Dear Vendor:

The Contracting Entity and the contracting vendor have the option of renewing Contract/Pricing
Agreement No. R22-C217059 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment and
Supplies for the term 10/24/2022 through 10/23/2023 under the same terms, conditions and
provisions as originally awarded, including price(s).

Please indicate your concurrence or non-concurrence by completing the below listed information,
including signature, and return to me by August 24, 2022. If the individual signing below is not
the owner or an officer of the business or corporation, a letter of authorization should also be
attached. Corporate Seal will be accepted in lieu of an authorization letter if affixed to this
document.

YOUR CONCURRENCE DOES NOT GUARANTEE RENEWAL. Should the Contracting
Entity decide not to renew the above contract, you will be notified in writing or
electronically. This form may be mailed, faxed, emailed, scanned, or otherwise
electronically submitted for contract/pricing agreement renewal.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (405) 297-3172, Fax (405) 297-2142 or
Email: jennifer.swann@okc.gov.

D

Jennifer Swann MPA, CPO Mike Fadden
Senior Buyer PRINTED NAME
CEO

X Yes, I would like to renew
per the above mentioned.
No, I do not wish to renew.

TITLE

AUFXHORIZED AGNATURE

alls, LLC
COMPANY NAME
[INTERNAL USE ONLY] 1340 Russell Cave Road
STREET ADDRESS
The Contracting Entity Lexington, KY 40505
chooses not to renew the CITY, STATE AND ZIP CODE
above contract/pricing 800-876-4242
agreement. BUSINESS TELEPHONE

bidreview@galls.com
CONTACT E-MAIL

Procurement Services 100 North Walker ¢ Oklahoma City, OK 73102 ¢ 405-297-2741



Swann, Jennifer

From: Vickers, Sharmanlyne R

Sent: Wednesday, September 7, 2022 10:28 AM

To: Swann, Jennifer; Croy, Alena M

Subject: RE: Renewal for R22-C217059 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment and Supplies
Approved.

From: Swann, Jennifer <jennifer.swann@okc.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, September 7, 2022 8:09 AM

To: Vickers, Sharmanlyne R <sharmanlyne.vickers@okc.gov>; Croy, Alena M <alena.croy@okc.gov>
Subject: RE: Renewal for R22-C217059 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment and Supplies

Good morning,

This vendor is requesting an increase, similar to the others on this renewal. He references the CPI-U, which I have
reviewed and confirmed in the attached.

With your approval I can move forward on the renewal for this commodity, Police Uniforms Accessories, Minor
Equipment and Supply, which expires in Oct.

Many thanks,
Jennifer

From: Allen, Dan <Allen-Dan@galls.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 6, 2022 7:56 PM

To: Swann, Jennifer <jennifer.swann@okc.gov>

Cc: Lennon, Ross <Lennon-Ross@galls.com>

Subject: RE: Renewal for R22-C217059 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment and Supplies

Hello, Jennifer.
Sorry for the delay. This has been in our Contract Management department and | have been traveling today.

As you know, raging inflation has been affecting our supply chain just like everything else. We would be happy to renew
this contract with a price increase of 8.5%, which mirrors the CPI.

Please let me know if you would like to proceed with this increase when you can.
Thank you for your time and consideration.

Daniel Allen | Business Development Executive
1340 Russell Cave Road | Lexington, KY 40505
Phone: 314.283.1554 | allen-dan@galls.com

L L$® PROUD TO SERVE AMERICA'S
PUBLIC SAFETY PROFESSIONALS™



jennifer.swann
Highlight

jennifer.swann
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Bureau of Labor Statistics » Economic News Release > Consumer Price Index

Economic News Release

Consumer Price Index Summary

Transmission of material in this release is embargoed until
8:30 a.m. (ET) August 10, 2822 UsDL-22-1625

Technical information: (202) 691-7800 * cpi_info@bls.gov * www.bls.gov/cpi
Media Contact: (202) 691-5982 * PressOffice@bls.gov

CONSUMER PRICE INDEX - JULY 2022

The Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers (CPI-U) was unchanged in July on a seasonally
adjusted basis after rising 1.3 percent in June, the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics reported today.
Over the last 12 months, the all items index increased 8.5 percent before seasonal adjustment.

The gasoline index fell 7.7 percent in July and offset increases in the food and shelter indexes,

resulting in the all items index being unchanged over the month. The energy index fell 4.6 percent
over the month as the indexes for gasoline and natural gas declined, but the index for electricity
increased. The food index continued to rise, increasing 1.1 percent over the month as the food at

home index rose 1.3 percent.

The index for all items less food and energy rose ©.3 percent in July, a smaller increase than in
April, May, or June. The indexes for shelter, medical care, motor vehicle insurance, household
furnishings and operations, new vehicles, and recreation were among those that increased over the
month. There were some indexes that declined in July, including those for airline fares, used cars
and trucks, communication, and apparel.

The all items index increased 8.5 percent for the 12 months ending July, a smaller figure than the
9.1-percent increase for the period ending June. The all items less food and energy index rose 5.9
percent over the last 12 months. The energy index increased 32.9 percent for the 12 months ending
July, a smaller increase than the 41,6-percent increase for the period ending June. The food index
increased 10.9 percent over the last year, the largest 12-month increase since the period ending
May 1979.

Table A. Percent changes in CPI for All Urban Consumers (CPI-U): U.S, city average

Seasonally adjusted changes from preceding month a d;::;: ed
12-mos.
Jan. Feb. Mar. Apr. May Jun. Jul. ended
2022 2022 2022 2022 2022 2022 2022 | Jul. 2022
All items 0.6 0.8 1.2 0.3 1.0 13 0.0 8.5
Food 0.9 1.0 1.0 0.9 1.2 1.0 i1 10.9
Food at home 1.0 1.4 1.5 1.0 1.4 1.0 1.3 13.1
Food away from home(1) 0.7 0.4 03 0.6 0.7 0.9 0.7 7.6
Energy 0.9 3.5 11.0 2.7 3.9 7.5 -4.6 329
Energy commodities -0.6 6.7 18.1 -5.4 4.5 104 -7.6 44.9
Gasoline (all types) -0.8 6.6 18.3 -6.1 4.1 11.2 -7.7 44,0
Fuel oil(1) 9.5 7.7 22.3 2.7 16.9 -1.2 -11.0 75.6
Energy services 29 -0.4 18 1.3 3.0 35 0.1 18.8
Electricity 4.2 <11 22 0.7 1.3 1.7 1.6 152
Utility (piped) gas service -0.5 1.5 0.6 3.1 8.0 8.2 -3.6 30.5
All items less food and energy 0.6 0.5 03 0.6 0.6 0.7 0.3 5.9
Commodities less food and energy commaodities 1.0 0.4 -0.4 0.2 0.7 0.8 0.2 7.0
New vehicles 0.0 0.3 0.2 11 1.0 0.7 0.6 10.4
Used cars and trucks 1.5 -0.2 -3.8 0.4 1.8 1.6 -0.4 6.6
Apparel 11 0.7 0.6 -0.8 0.7 0.8 -0.1 51
,Medical care commodities(1) 0.9 0.3 0.2 0.1 0.3 0.4 0.6 37
Services less energy services 0.4 0.5 0.6 0.7 0.6 0.7 0.4 5.5
Shelter 0.3 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.6 0.6 0.5 5.7
Transpartation services ' 1.0 14 20/ 31 13 21 0.5 9.2
Medical care services <~ 0.6 0.1 0.6 0.5 0.4 0.7 0.4 5.1
Footnotes
(1)_Not seasonally adjusted.
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Food

The food index increased 1.1 percent in July; this was the seventh consecutive monthly increase of
8.9 percent or more, The food at home index rose 1.3 percent in July as all six major grocery store
food group indexes increased. The index for nonalcoholic beverages rose the most, increasing 2.3
percent as the index for coffee rose 3.5 percent. The index for other food at home rose 1.8 percent,
as did the index for cereals and bakery products. The index For dairy and related products
increased 1.7 percent over the month. The index for meats, poultry, fish, and eggs rase 0.5 percent
in July after declining in June. The index for fruits and vegetables also increased 6.5 percent
over the month.

The food away from home index rose 8.7 percent in July after rising 8.9 percent in June. The index
for limited service meals increased 9,8 percent and the index for full service meals increased 9.6
percent over the month,

The food at home index rose i3.1 percent over the last 12 months, the largest 12-month increase
since the period ending March 1979. The index for other food at home rose 15.8 percent and the
index for cereals and bakery products increased 15.0 percent over the year. The remaining major
grocery store focd proups posted increases ranging from 9.3 percent (fruits and vegetabies) to 14.9
percent (dairy and related products).

The index for foed away from home rose 7.6 percent over the last year. The index for full service
meals rose 8.9 percent over the last 12 months, and the index for limited service meals rosa 7.2
percent over the last year,

Energy

The energy index fell 4.6 percent in July after rising 7.5 percent in June. The gasoline index feil
7.7 percent over the month following an 11.2-percent increase in June. {Before seasonal adjustment,
gasoline prices fell 7.7 percent in July.) The index for natural gas declined in July after sharp
recent increases, falling 3.6 percent. However, the electricity index increased in July, rising 1.6
percent, its third consecutive monthly increase of at least 1,3 percent.

The energy index rose 32.9 pepcent over the past 12 meonths. The gasoline index increased 44.9
percent cver the span and the fuel oll index rose 75.6 percent. The index for electricity rose 15.2
percent, the largest 12-month lncrease since the period ending February 2046, The index for natural
gas increased 30.5 percent over the last 12 months.

All items less fcod and energy

The index for all items less food and energy rose @.3 percent in July after increasing 9.7 percent
in June. The shelter index continved to rise but did post a smaller increase than the prior month,
increasing 8.5 percent in July compared to 8.6 percent in June, The reat index rose 0.7 percent in
July and the owners' equivalent rent index rose @.6 percent. The index for lodging away from home
continued to decline, falling 2.7 percent in July after a 2.8-percent decrease in June,

The medical care index rose @.4 percent in July after rising 8.7 perceat in June as major medical
care component indexes continued to imcrease. The index for hospital services increased 8.5 percent
over the month, while the indexes for physicians' services and for prescription drugs both
increased 9.3 percent in July.

The iadex for motor vehicle insurance continued to increase, rising 1.3 percent in July after
increasing 1.9 percent in June. The index for household furnishings and operations rose 8.6 percent
after increasing @.4 percent in June. The new vehicles index also increased €.6 percent in July,
and the recreation index rose 8.3 percent over the month. Other indexes that increased in July
include personal care (+0.4 percent), alcoholic beverages (+0.5 percent), tobacco (+98.3 percent},
and education {+8.1 percent).

The iadex for airline fares fell sharply in July, decreasing 7.8 percent. The index for used cars
and trucks also declined over the month, falling 0.4 percent after rising in May and 3June. The
communication index fell 8.4 percent ir July, and the apparel index fell 8.1 percent after rising
the prior two months.

The jadex for all items less food and energy rose 5.9 percent over the past 12 months, the same
increase as the period ending June, The shelter index rose 5.7 percent over the last year,
accounting for about 49 percent of the total increase in all items less food and energy. Several
transportation indexes aiso rose notably over the last year, including new vehicles (+19.4 percent),
used cars and trucks {+6.6 percent), motor vehicle insurance (+7.4 percent), and airline fares
(+27.7 percent),

Not seasonally adjusted CPI measures

The Consumer Price Index for All Urban Cansumers (CPI-U) increased B.5 percent over the last 12
months to an index level of 296.276 (1982-84=16@). For the month, the index was unchanged prior to
seasonal adjustment,

The Consumer #rice Index for Urban Wage Earners and Clerical Workers (CPI-W) increased 9.1 percent
aver the last 12 months to an index level of 292.219 (1982-84=1@8). For the month, the index
deciined @.1 percent prior to seasonal adjustment.

The Chained Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers (C-CPI-U) increased 8.9 percent over the
last 12 meonths. For the month, the index increased @.1 percent on a not seasonally adjusted basis,
Please note that the indexes for the past 1@ to 12 months are subject to revision.

The Cansumer Price Index for August 2822 is scheduled te be released on Tuesday, September i3, 2022 at 8:368 a.m. (ET),

Technical Note

Brief Explapation of the CPL
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The Consumer Price Index {CPI) measures the change in prices paid by consumers for goods
and services. The CPI reflects spending patterns for each of two population groups: all
urban consumers and urban wage earners and clerical workers. The all urban consumer group
represents about 93 percent of the total U.S. population. It is based on the expenditures
of almost all residents of urban or metropolitan areas, including professionals, the self
-employed, the poor, the unemployed, and retired people, as well as urban wage earners
and clerical workers. Not included in the CPI are the spending patterns of people living
in rural nonmetropolitan areas, farming families, people in the Armed Forces, and those
in institutions, such as prisons and mesntal hospitals. Consumer inflation for all urban
consumers is measured by two indexes, namely, the Consumer Price Index for All Urban
Consumers (CPI-U) and the Chained Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers (C-CPI-U}.
The Consumer Price Index for Urban Wage Earners and Clerical Workers (CPI-W) is based on
the expenditures of households included in the CPI-U definition that meet two requirements:
more than one-half of the household's income must come from clerical or wage occupations,
and at least one of the househeld's earners must have been employed for at least 37 weeks
during the previous 12 months. The CPI-W population represents about 29 percent of the
total U.S. population and is a subset of the CPI-U population.

The CPIs are based on prices of food, clothing, shelter, fuels, transportation, doctors'
and dentists® services, drugs, and other goods and services that people buy for day-to-day
living. Prices are collected each month in 75 urban areas across the couwtry from about
6,808 housing units and approximately 22,080 retail establishments {department stores,
supermarkets, hospitals, filling stations, and other types of stores and service
establishments). All taxes directly associated with the purchase and use of items are
included in the index. Prices of fuels and & few other Items are obtained every month in
all 75 locations. Prices of most other commodities and services are collected every month
in the three largest gecgraphic areas and every other month in ather areas. Prices of most
goods and services are obtained by personal visit, telephone call, or web collection by the
Bureau's trained representatives.

In calculating the index, price changes for the various items in each location are
aggregated using weights, which represent their importance in the spending of the
appropriate population group. Local data are then combined to obtain a U.S. city average.
For the CPI-U and CPI-W, separate indexes are also published by size of city, by region of
the country, for cross-classifications of regions and population-size classes, and for 23
selacted local areas. Area indexes do not measure differences in the level of prices among
cities; they only measure the average change in prices for each area since the base period.
For the C-CPI-U, data are lssued only at the national level. The CPI-U and CPI-W are
considered final when released, but the C-CPI-U is issued in preliminary form and subject
to three subsequent quarterly revisions.

The index measures price change from a designed reference date. For most of the CPI-U and
the CPI-W, the reference base is 1982-84 equals 1@2. The reference base for the C-CPI-U is
December 1999 equals 188, An increase of 7 percent from the reference base, for example,
is shown as 167.88@, Alternatively, that relationship can also be expressed as the price
of a base period market basket of goods and services rising from $1e@ to $107,

sampling Error in the CPI

The CPI is a statistical estimate that is subject to sampling error because it is based
upon a sample of retail prices and not the complete universe of all prices. BLS calculates
and publishes estimates of the 1-momth, 2-month, 6-month, and 12-month percent change
standard errors annually for the CPI-U, These standard error estimates can be used to
construct confidence intervals for hypothesis testing. For example, the estimated standard
error of the 1-month percent change is 9.03 percent for the U.5, all items CPI. This means
that if we repeatedly sample from the uéniverse of all retail prices using the same
methodology, and estimate a percentage change for each sample, then 95 percent of these
estimates will be within 8,86 percent of the 1-month percentage change based on all retail
prices. For example, for a il-month change of €.2 percent in the all items CPI-U, we are 95
percent confident that the actual percent change based on all retail prices would fall
between 0,14 and ©,26 percent. For the latest data, including information on how to use
the estimates of standard error, see www.bls.gov/cpiftables/variance~estimates/home.him.

Calculating Index Changes

Movements of the indexes from 1 month to another are usually expressed as percent changes

rather than changes in index points, because index point changes are affected by the level
of the index in relation to its base period, while percent changes are not. The following

table shows an example of using index values to calculate percent changes:

Item A Item B Item C
Year I 112.500 225,800 118.008
Year II 12%.508 243.0800 128.008
Change in index points 9,000 18.¢00 13.080
Percent change 9.6/112.580 x 169 = 8.6 18.8/225.800 x 166 = 8.8 18.6/116.4800 x 188 = 16.4

Use of Seasonally Adjusted and Unadjusted Data

The Consumer Price Index {CPI) produces both unadjusted and seasonally adjusted data.
Seasonally adjusted data are computed using seascnal factors derived by the X-13ARIMA-SEATS
seasonal adjustment method. These factors are updated each February, and the new factors are
used to raevise the previous 5 years of seasonally adjusted data. The factors are available
at www.bls.gov/cpi/tables/seasonal-adjustment/seasondl-factors-2822%.x1sx. For more
information on data revision scheduling, please see the Factsheet on Seasonal Adjustment at
v, bls.gov/cpi/seasonal-adiustment/questions-and-answers.htm and the Timeline of Seasonal
Adjustment Methodological Changes at

vt . bls . gov/cpi/seasonal-adjustment/timeline-seasonal -adjustment-methodology-changes.htm.

For analyzing short-term price trends in the economy, seasonally adjusted changes are usually
preferred since they eliminate the effect of changes that normally occur at the same time and
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in about the same magnitude every year-such as price movements resulting from weather evenis,
praoduction cycles, model changeovers, holidays, and sales. This allows data users to focus on
changes that are not typical for the time of year. The unadjusted data are of primary interest
to consumers concerned about the prices they actually pay. Unadjusted data are also used
extensively for escalation purposes. Many collective bargeining contract agreements and pension
plans, for example, tie compensation changes to the Consumer Price Index before adjustment for
seasonal variation. BiS advises against the use of seasonally adjusted data in escalation
agreements because seasonally adjusted series are revised annually.

Entervention Analysis

The Bureau of Labor Statistics uses intervention analysis seasonal adjusiment (EASA) for some
CPT serfies. Sometimes extreme values or sharp movements can distort the underlying seasonal
pattern of price change. Intervention analysis seasonal adjustment is a process by which the
distortions caused by such unusual events are estimated and removed from the data prioe to
calculation of seasonal factors. The resulting seasonal factors, which more accurately represent
the seasonal pattern, are then applied to the unadjusted data.

For example, this procedure was used for the motor fuel series to offset the effects of the 2009
return to normal pricing after the worldwide econcmic downturn in 2808, Retaining this outlier
data during seasonal factor calculation would distort the computation of the seasonal portion

of the time series data for motor fuel, so it was estimated and removed from the data prior to
seasonal adjustment. Following that, seasonal factors were calculated based on this "prior
adjusted” data. These seasonal factors represent a clearer picture of the seasanal pattern in
the data, The last step is for moter fuel seasonal factors to be applied to the unadjusted data.

For the seasonal factors introduced for January 2022, BLS adjusted 72 series usiang intervention
analysis seasonal adjustment, including selected food and beverage items, motor fuels, electricity,
and vehicles.

Revision of Seasonally Adjusted Indexes

seasonally adjusted data, including the U.5. city average sll items index levels, are subject to
revision for up to 5 years after their original release. Every year, economists in the CPI
calculate new seasoral factors for seasonally adjusted series and apply them to the last 5 vears
of data, Seasonally adjusted indexes beyond the last 5 years of data are considered to be final
and not subject to revision, For Jaznuary 2022, revised seasonal factors and seasonally adjusted
indexes for 2017 to 2821 were calculated and published. For series which are directly adjusted
using the Census X-13ARIMA-SEATS seasonal adjustment software, the seasonal factors for 2021 wilil
be applied to data for 2022 to produce the seasenally adjusted 2022 indexes, Series which are
indirectly seasonally adjusted by summing seasonally adjusted component series have seasonal
factors which are derived and are therefore not available in advapce,

Determining Seasonal Status

Each year the seasonal status of every series is reevaluated based upon certain statistical
criteria. Using these criteria, BLS economists determine whether a series should change its
status from "not seasonally adjusted” to "seasonally adjusted”, or vice versa. If any of the 81
components of the U.S, city average all items index change their seasonal adjustment status from
seasonally adjusted to not seascnally adjusted, not seasonally adjusted data will be used in the
aggregation of the dependent series for the last 5 years, buf the seasonally adjusted indexes
before that pericd will not be changed. For 2821, 22 of the Bl components of the U.5. city
average all items index are seasonally adjusted.

Contact Information

For additional information about the CPI visit www.bls.gov/cpi or contact the CPI Information and
Analysis Section at 202-691-7€@9 or cpi_infogbls.gov.

For additional information on seasonal adjustment in the CPI visit
www.bls,gov/cpl/seasonal -adjustment /home. htm or contact the CPI seasonal adjustment section at
292-691-8968 or cpiseas@bls.gov.

If you are deaf, hard of hearing, or have 2 speech disability, please dial 7-1-1 to access
telecommunications relay services.

« Tabie 1. Consumer Price [ndex for All Urhan Consumers (CPI-U): U. S. city average, by expenditure category

» Table 2, Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers (CPI-U): U, S, city average, by detailed expenditure category

» Table 3. Consumer Price |ndex for All Urban Consumers (CPI-L): U. S, city average, special aggregate indexes

» Table 4. Consumer Price [ndex for All Urban Consumers (CPL-U); Selected areas, afl items index

» Table 5. Chained Consumer Price Index for Alt Urban Consumers {C-CPE-U) and the Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers (CPE-U); LS. city average, alt ltems index

« fable §. Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers (CP#-UL U.S

ty average, by expenditure category, 1-manth analysis table

. Cj
» Iable 7. Consumer Price fndex for All Urban Consumers (CPi-US: ULS. city ave
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U.S5. BUREALU OF LABOR STATESTICS Division of Consumer Prices and Price Indexes Suite 3130 2 Massachusetts Avenue NE
Washington, BC 20212-0001

Telephone: 1-202-691-7000_ www.bls.gov/CPI Contact CPI
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The City of
OKLAHOMA CITY

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

August 2, 2022 AP PROVE D

MTM Recognition Corporation 9-27-2022

3405 SE 29th Street BY THE CITY COUNCIL

(v % Sigosn CITY CLERK
Del City, OK 73115 e

Dear Vendor:

The Contracting Entity and the contracting vendor have the option of renewing Contract/Pricing
Agreement No. R22-C217060 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment and
Supplies for the term 10/24/2022 through 10/23/2023 under the same terms, conditions and
provisions as originally awarded, including price(s).

Please indicate your concurrence or non-concurrence by completing the below listed information,
including signature, and return to me by August 24, 2022. If the individual signing below is not
the owner or an officer of the business or corporation, a letter of authorization should also be
attached. Corporate Seal will be accepted in lieu of an authorization letter if affixed to this
document.

YOUR CONCURRENCE DOES NOT GUARANTEE RENEWAL. Should the Contracting
Entity decide not to renew the above contract, you will be notified in writing or
electronically. This form may be mailed, faxed, emailed, scanned, or otherwise
electronically submitted for contract/pricing agreement renewal.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (405) 297-3172, Fax (405) 297-2142 or
Email: jennifer.swann@okc.gov.

D

Jennifer Swann MPA, CPO Mike Ketcherside
Senior Buyer PRINTED NAME
CSO
X Yes, I would like to renew TITLE ) W
per the above mentioned. W
No, I do not wish to renew. AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE
MTM Recognition Corp.
COMPANY NAME
[INTERNAL USE ONLY] 3201 SE 29th Street
STREET ADDRESS
The Contracting Entity Oklahoma City, OK 73115
chooses not to renew the CITY, STATE AND ZIP CODE
above contract/pricing 1-877-686-7464
agreement. BUSINESS TELEPHONE

ketch@mtmrecognition.com
CONTACT E-MAIL

Procurement Services 100 North Walker ¢ Oklahoma City, OK 73102 ¢ 405-297-2741



The City of
OKLAHOMA CITY

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

August 2, 2022

A PPROVE D
Special OPS Uniforms Inc 9.97.9092
505 N Portland
Oklahoma City, OK 73107 BY THE CITY COUNCIL

(g Yngsr CITY CLERK

Dear Vendor:

The Contracting Entity and the contracting vendor have the option of renewing Contract/Pricing
Agreement No. R22-C217061 for Police Uniforms Accessories Minor Equipment and
Supplies for the term 10/24/2022 through 10/23/2023 under the same terms, conditions and
provisions as originally awarded, including price(s).

Please indicate your concurrence or non-concurrence by completing the below listed information,
including signature, and return to me by August 24, 2022. If the individual signing below is not
the owner or an officer of the business or corporation, a letter of authorization should also be
attached. Corporate Seal will be accepted in lieu of an authorization letter if affixed to this
document.

YOUR CONCURRENCE DOES NOT GUARANTEE RENEWAL. Should the Contracting
Entity decide not to renew the above contract, you will be notified in writing or
electronically. This form may be mailed, faxed, emailed, scanned, or otherwise
electronically submitted for contract/pricing agreement renewal.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (405) 297-3172, Fax (405) 297-2142 or
Email: jennifer.swann@okc.gov.

D

Jennifer Swann MPA, CPO Daniel A Tate, Jr
Senior Buyer PRINTED NAME
President
X Yes, I would like to renew TITLE
per the above mentioned. and attached f};)—n . O A T O
No, I do not wish to renew. Updates on AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE =~ /U
page #2. SPECIAL OPS Uniforms, Inc
COMPANY NAME
[INTERNAL USE ONLY] 505 N Portland Ave
STREET ADDRESS
The Contracting Entity OKC , OK 73107
chooses not to renew the CITY, STATE AND ZIP CODE
above contract/pricing 405-946-3504
agreement. BUSINESS TELEPHONE

brandon@specialopsuniforms.com
CONTACT E-MAIL

Procurement Services 100 North Walker ¢ Oklahoma City, OK 73102 ¢ 405-297-2741



SPECIAL OPS Uniforms,

Inc. 2022 renewal

Adjustments to OCPD contract pricing.

Custom Poly/Wool
Custom Poly/Wool
Custom Poly/Wool
Custom Poly/Wool

ASP Talon Batons

Class
Class
Class
Class

A Long Sleeve Shirts
A Short Sleeve Shirts
A Trousers

A Tke Jackets

All other contract items

£§Hu¢m19-/4 72%&55%

$124.
$112.
$119.
$359.

$129.

+8.

99
99
99
99

99

25

o\°
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